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ENERGY INTEGRATION AS AN ELEMENT  
OF EU SECURITY IN A HISTORICAL OUTLINE 

The civilization development in Europe significantly influenced the priorities when it comes 
to national security within European countries. The energy security became a valid aspect of 
properly functioning country. Europe, which fossil sources are limited, is forced to secure the 
sufficient amount of fossil sources supplies, that guarantees the energy security for EU coun-
tries. The key aspect seems to be the diversification of supplies, differentiation of energy bal-
ance through increased use of renewable energy sources and increasing the energy effective-
ness. However, Russia which is the main supplier of the fossil sources to Europe is some 
extreme circumstances may become the main threat. Such complex security environment re-
quires implementation of fully integrated internal market, that would be resistant to external 
threats, thanks to optimally planned distribution, regional cooperation and development of 
reverse flows infrastructure. The article is a synthesis of the current state and has the character 
of a historical analysis for which methods of analysis and criticism of documents were used. 

Keywords: energy security, EU policy on energy, EU energy, EU-Russia relation, diversifi-
cation of energy supplies, European common energy market. 

1. INTRODUCTION 

 Energy was the main factor allowing prehistoric tribes to survive and develop. At first, 
energy was used mainly as a source of heat and light. Also, it provided a sense of physical 
security. Through the years, the importance of energy was growing and it was used by peo-
ple much more often in everyday life. However, a great breakthrough could be observed in 
20th century and the electricity became the main medium. The technological progress re-
sulted in increasing the necessity for energy, which resulted in situation that energy sector 
became the most challenging and important in all countries around the world. Such situation 
changed the perception of energy security in EU countries. A limited amount of fossil 
sources forced EU countries to align with each other and as a result a common internal 
energy market was formed. In a creating process of the article, the author used the method 
of analysis and criticism of source materials, as well as the method of analysis and criticism 
of literature on the subject and provides a historical analysis of the European security ener-
getic process. 
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2. THE ESSENCE OF SECURITY 

 The issue of security has its beginnings as far as the first civilizations were sat. It was 
always an important element of people’s needs. In general, the security is a state of calm-
ness, it’s a lack of threats and dangerous situations, which may influence on individuals or 
whole nations. The security guarantees confidence and possibilities to develop and improve 
it (Słownik z zakresu bezpieczeństwa narodowego, 2008). The definition of security has 
been changing over the centuries. As a result, a lot of different security branches were cre-
ated, including energy security. 
 Analyzing security criteria a definition of “nation” must be discussed. According to An-
drzej Czupryński “nation is a total amount of citizens living on a certain area, sharing the 
same language and cultural background. They have common political and economic inter-
ests. Nation is bounded by ethnic and cultural bounds, which are passed through genera-
tions. The sense of national identity is an effect of being a part of group which shares the 
same history” (Czupryński, 2015). The national security is often defined as a similar to 
country security. However, the nation differs from country. According to Andrzej 
Czupryński country is “a political, sovereign organization, which serves a particular func-
tions and covers the community living in a certain area. The main aim of the country is to 
secure the national interests”. The national security is responsible for being aware of poten-
tial threats and able to react in dangerous situations. Moreover, national security is obliged 
to provide a necessary means of surviving, provide stabilization and quality of life. All of 
those can be implemented by state institutions, which as political organization possess fi-
nancial resources. The international security is defined as “protection of all nations and 
countries around the world from threats, development of countries. The international secu-
rity is implemented by developing and creating national and international institutions, 
which are associated in one international security system”. Summing up, the issue security 
is connected mainly with people, nations and the methods how to secure they needs, basic 
values, development and quality of life (Czupryński, 2015). 

The issue security is related to the “issue” which is supposed to be secured and the 
methods how to achieve it. Such security creates a wide spectrum of means for security 
formation , which are still developed and increased in number (Czupryński, 2015). The 
energy security is one of the most crucial among all security branches nowadays. 

3. ENERGY SECURITY 

The energy is a factor which was present is people’s life form the very beginning. Firstly, 
it was used to lit a fire in order to prepare meals. Together with civilization development 
the forms of energy use were increased and specialized. There are six basic changes in  
energy use over the centuries: 

• Initial; 
• Hunting; 
• Early-agricultural; 
• Late-agricultural; 
• Industrial; 
• Technological (Łęcki, 2015). 
Each of this stages characterized in increase of the energy use. In the first stage the 

prehistoric human used 2 thousand kcal per day, meanwhile nowadays this amount has been 
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increased almost seventy times and it equals 150 thousand kcal per day (Łęcki, 2015). This 
factor clearly shows how consumption of energy was booted. The energy became the most 
crucial element of everyday life. Its maintenance and obtaining of the new sources became 
the priority to the whole world. The awareness of the importance of energy in proper func-
tioning of countries, nations and institutions led to the development of new security sector 
which is called energy security (Łęcki, 2015). The general definition of energy security was 
defined in the Energy Security Law as a state of economy enabling covering the future 
needs for supplies of fuel and energy according to technical and economical possibilities, 
which must be environmental friendly (Energy Law Act 1997 (Art. 3, No. 16). There are 
many definitions of energy security, which were named in different acts and laws, however, 
all definitions at first seems to be similar, many differ from each other in some aspects. 
Taking into consideration all known definitions, four main general aspects of energy secu-
rity may be named: 

• Minimization of the negative effects for environment; 
• Balance between supply and demand for energy; 
• Ability to cover the demand for energy; 
• Introduction of economic mechanism allowing to improve the performance of energy 

market (Jankowska, 2015). 
Each of those aspects are crucial for national energy security. If they are not executed it 

may lead to severe industrial, economic or social crisis.  

4. THE EVOLUTION OF EU ENERGY POLICY 

The first attempt to develop a common energy policy in Europe was made on 9th May 
1950 in declaration called the Schuman Declaration (https://europa.eu/european- 
-union/about-eu/symbols/europe-day/schuman-declaration_pl ). Schuman presented a plan 
to form an international organization, which would take control over French and German 
production of coal and steel. Also, the organization was supposed to be independent form 
French and German governments. The idea allowed other countries to join the organization. 
On 18th April 1951 in Paris Belgium, France, the Netherlands, Luxemburg, Germany and 
Italy signed a treaty which resulted in forming The European Coal and Steel Community. 
The main reason for forming the community was to unite European countries economically 
and politically in order to secure lasting peace (Ruszel, 2016). The main pillar of the inte-
gration was the coal sector. In the 50s, almost 90% of energy was obtained from the coal. 
The ECSC was formed mainly in order to control the coal and steel sources and to develop 
a common market, which was supposed to secure ECSC countries with regular supplies. 
Also, it allowed to remove the duty and quantitative limitation (Nehrebecki, 2008).  

A rapid development of ECSC countries resulted in the increase of energy supplies and 
fossil sources. Although, the coal was mined in Western Europe, the other sources such as 
liquid fuel had to be imported from other countries. Such situation forced ECSC countries 
to search for alternative energy sources. One of the main method was to invest in nuclear 
energy. In 1955 in Mesina all ECSC countries decided to create a committee that would be 
responsible for developing nuclear energy in Europe. The decision led to singing two very 
important treaties. In 1957 in Rome two new communities were established: the European 
Economic Community and the European Atomic Energy Community. They came to live on 
1st January 1958. The main idea of the EEC was an enhancement in developing and inte-



44 W. Lewicki 

gration of community countries, reinforcement of economic stability and creating a com-
mon market or free trade area. In order to fulfill those assumptions a number of tasks had 
been assigned, such as: reduction of duties between ECC countries, unification of duties for 
countries that didn’t belong to community, free movement of services, goods and capital. 
Meanwhile, the main idea of EATC was a prompt development of nuclear energy, which 
was supposed to result in increasing of energy security and energy self-sufficiency of Com-
munity countries. It was assumed that nuclear energy as cheaper and more environmental 
friendly in comparison to other sources would play a crucial role in the future energy  
balance (Nehrebecki, 2008). However, soon it came clear that nuclear energy generated 
high cost when it came to electricity production. Another factor which seemed to be crucial 
was a conflict between France and EU Commission. France possessed a more significant 
technological potential when it came to nuclear production than other EU countries. This 
situation led to difficulties in reaching a consensus between EU Commission and France in 
terms of financial support. EU Commission was convinced that already known technologi-
cal solution should have been improved, whereas France was more eager to invest in new 
more advanced technologies. Additionally, EU Commission considered the EATC as an 
instrument of West Europe countries’ integration in terms of energy security, whereas 
French government tended to see it as way for financial and technological support for its 
own ideas. Those two different outlooks resulted in decreasing of the EATC’s budget 
(Doliwa-Klepacki, 2005). Moreover, new sources of petroleum and natural gas were dis-
covered. The import of those became more affordable and the nuclear energy declined in 
interest (Ruszel, 2016).  

However, in the 70s, it came clear that import of cheap petroleum wouldn’t last long.  
A huge demand for petroleum in Europe and the US led to the problems in supplies. In 
addition, the outburst of Arab-Israeli war in 1973 resulted in imposing an embargo on Eu-
ropean countries and the US, which were in alliance with Israel. The embargo effected al-
most all world markets and led to a severe economic crisis. The petroleum crisis ultimately 
ended the era of carless petroleum use, also it showed how much EU countries depended 
on this source and how different were their priorities. This experience resulted in change of 
policy within ECC countries, the integration among countries became less important. Now, 
the individual countries security policies were seen as a priority (Bodio, 2009). This change 
was an impulse for establishing new law acts by the Council of the European Communities. 
The acts were supposed to secure the supplies of energy sources. However, the second pe-
troleum crisis (1979–1980) became the fundamental for today’s energy security in Europe 
(Ruszel, 2015). One of the main act was The European Act signed in 1986, it amended and 
supplemented the Rome Treaty. It obliged all ECC countries to establish one internal mar-
ket, rationally use of the fossil sources and it changed the decision making method within 
the European Council (Bodio, 2009). Another document was so called “Green Paper” (The 
EU Council Working Document, (1998) Internal energy market, COM (88) 238 final, 
Brussels), it was prepared and enacted by the European Commission in 1988. The act high-
lighted the importance of one internal energy market, also, it presented the main reasons 
why European community still had problems with full integration. The Green Paper was 
considered to be the engine for all community counters (Nehrebecki, 2008). 

The next years brought another acts which were supposed to enhance energy security in 
Europe. In 1991 the European Energy Charter was singed in the Hague. It was one of the 
most significant acts connected with the European energy security. It was signed by 46 
countries. The document was a political and economic declaration, which was seen as an 
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opportunity for a more effective international cooperation within the energy sources supply 
sector (Nehrebecki, 2008). The next mile stone in the way of further energy integration was 
an act signed on 7th December 1992 in Maastricht known as the Treaty on European Union. 
The treaty was a breakthrough, because it officially declared the formation of European 
Union . Also, it defined the main aims, and introduced significant changes when it came to 
energy policy. Now, the energy policy was supposed to be based on different regulations, 
such as: the growth and development of trans European transmission systems (connecting 
already existing transmission systems in order to boost their competitiveness and effective-
ness, investment in high-pressure gas pipelines to simplify the gas supplies form external 
markets). Moreover, rational use of European energy sources and introduction of renewable 
energy were seen as priorities (Nehrebecki, 2008).  

The Treaty on European Union liberalized and liberated energy sector in Europe. The 
European Commission consequently implemented new policy through acts and bills. In 
1995 the “Green Paper” was signed. The act became a pretext for a multi-month discussion 
over the main aims of energy policy. The long discussion resulted in signing the “White 
Paper”, which was fully devoted to energy policy in Europe. The White Paper listed the 
main energy policy targets, such as: energy security, economic competiveness, continuous 
energy supply and protection of natural environment (Dobroczyńska, 2003). Subsequently, 
The EU Parliament and the European Council passed two directives: 96/92/WE (European 
Parliament and the Council Directive of 19th December 1996 on common rules for internal 
market in electricity) and 98/30/WE (European Parliament and the Council Directive of 
22nd June 1998 on common rules for internal market in natural gas). The former was de-
voted to regulation within internal energy market, such as: effective management of energy 
production, transfer and distribution, the latter described spectrum of regulations within in-
ternal natural gas market (Nehrebecki, 2008). Overall objective of those directives was to 
continue and develop energy policy in Europe by opening of the market and unobstructed 
access to energy systems (Ruszel, 2015). In 2000, another important act was signed. The 
Green Paper European Strategy for Energy Security. The act enumerated the main threats 
connected with the fact that EU countries were more and more depended on external energy 
sources supplies, also it presented statistics that showed that European Union was the sec-
ond energy consumer in the world. The document appointed strategic targets for energy 
security, such as: diversification of gas supplies, development of strategic gas reserves, bal-
anced energy policy (Common EU Gas Market..., p. 73). The Green Paper resulted in new 
directives: “2003/55/WE (26th June 2003) connected with natural gas supply market re-
pealing 98/30/WE (Directive European Parliament and the Council Directive of 26th June 
2003 on common rules for internal market in gas) and 2004/67/WE (26th April 2004) de-
voted to measures to provide for gas supply security (Directive of 26th April 2004 on 
measures necessary to ensure the safety on gas supplies). Also, 1775/2005 Regulation 
passed by the EU Parliament and EU Council on 28th September 2005 connected with gas 
transmission systems conditions (European Parliament and Council Regulation of 28th Sep-
tember 2005 on requirements for gas transmission networks)”.  

In 2006 the first gas crisis occurred, which resulted in cut-off gas supplies from Russia 
to EU countries. The cut-off was the outcome of the lack of agreement between Russia  
and Ukraine in terms of gas transmission costs. As a result, on 1st January 2006 Russian 
GAZPROM partly cut off Ukraine from gas supplies. This also affected EU countries,  
because a part of gas pipeline which led to EU was on the Ukrainian territory. The gas 
obstruction lasted only for few days, but it was strongly noticeable by all EU countries 
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including Poland. The gas crisis made EU governments aware of the fact that they became 
too depended on external supplies. The EU organizations began to work on new projects, 
which were supposed to increase energy security. Finally, two new acts were passed: the 
Green Paper European strategy for balanced, competitive and safe energy and statement 
European Energy Policy (Ruszel, 2016). The former described EU priorities when it came 
to energy policy: constant development of internal electricity and gas market, supply sector 
security, reinforcement of EU countries solidarity, expansion of renewable energy sources, 
common external energy policy. The latter enumerated a number of challenges, targets, plan 
of action and measures used to implement energy policy (Ruszel, 2016). Equally, the third 
energy package was presented. The package assumed the growth in energy efficiency by 
20%, the increase in the use of renewable sources by 20% and reducing CO2 emission by 
20% in 2020 (Ruszel, 2016). Additionally, in Lisbon in 2007 was signed a significant treaty. 
27 countries declared that the European Union was due to be transformed into an unified 
international organization, also the competences of EU and individual countries were  
specified. The treaty was a mile stone for an internal European energy policy. The main 
targets of the internal energy policy were: ensuring the functioning of the energy market 
and security of energy supply, promoting energy efficiency, the development of renewable 
forms of energy and prompting energy networks (Ruszel, 2016).  

Unfortunately, in 2009, the second gas crisis occurred. Again, it was a result of Russian- 
-Ukrainian conflict. In November, 2008 GAZPROM requested from Ukraine to repay the 
debit of 2,4 billion dollars. Additionally, Russia accused Ukrainian NAFTOHAZ of trying 
to take over the gas pipeline leading to the EU countries. The accusation resulted in termi-
nation of the negotiation between GAZPROM and NAFTOHAZ, and on 1st January 2009 
the gas transmission was fully cut off. A decline in gas supply level was noticeable in all 
European counters, including Poland. Thanks to increasing of gas transmission form Bela-
rus and under the Black Sea, EU countries avoided being fully cut off form gas supplies. 
The negotiations between Russia and Ukraine was finished on 9th January 2009 and ratified 
on 12th January by all sides (Common EU Gas Market…, p. 68).  

In 2014, another gas crisis happened and as the previous one, it was a result of Russian 
Ukrainian conflict. The main cause of 2014 crisis was the Russian gas price increase. Ne-
gotiations between both countries were long and tough, and they didn’t solve the issue, so 
Ukrainian debt increased to 5,3 billion dollars. GAZPROM introduced pre-payment so 
when Ukrainian gas transmission was cut off, the EU countries wasn’t affected by it. The 
negotiations lasted until October, 2014 when both sides reached the agreement (Common 
EU Gas Market…, p. 68). 

The process of establishing a common energy policy in Europe was long and tedious. 
The main pillar of energy security was liberalization of internal market, protection and di-
versification of energy sources supply. Gas crises which occurred in last years, was a clear 
sign that there was many aspects that needed to be improved. Also, it was a main factor for 
more effective integration and cooperation between EU countries. It is worth mentioning, 
that apart from common European policy, the integration and cooperation is also visible in 
the individual countries. As an example, some energy companies lobby their interest in one 
country, but it may also affect the whole EU. The same situation may occur when energy 
companies try to influence on national politics in order to have an impact on political deci-
sions. Such circumstances may lead to undermine integration and solidarity between par-
ticular countries (Ruszel, 2016). It seems that the most important challenge is connected 
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with the fully integrated internal market, better regional cooperation, development of trans-
mission systems and infrastructure, which are they key for energy security.  
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